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INTRODUCTION 

 
The psycholinguistic model of receptive types of 
speech activity (reading and listening) "from the 
bottom up" opposes the model of understanding 
and processing information "from the top down". 
The bottom-up model is based on the idea of 
reading and listening as sequentially unfolding 
processes of decoding incoming information "from 
below", that is, from recognizing graphemes and 
phonemes to words, from words to sentences, from 
sentences to super-phrasal units and to 
understanding the text as a whole. This model 
explains how information received in the form of 

graphic or audio signals is transformed and stored 
in the students’ memory of a written or oral 
message. The bottom-up model not only defines the 
approach to extracting information from the text, 
but also outlines the way to form the speech 
functional system of a foreign language - the 
piecemeal assimilation of all the main components 
of this system, their accumulation, integration. The 
ultimate goal is considered to be the unification of 
all elements into one whole, that is, the 
understanding of the text read or listened to.  
 
Top-down and bottom-up approaches in English 
lessons. 
 
In many cases, students are in a bottom-up learning 
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mode. They are desperately trying to understand 
every single word in the text they are listening to. 
Unfortunately, in many situations this is simply not 
possible. They are often disappointed and just give 
up. Therefore, it should be remembered that during 
top-down text processing, the reader or listener 
gets a general view of the passage to read or listen 
to. In the process of processing "from the bottom 
up", the reader or listener focuses on individual 
words and phrases and achieves understanding by 
connecting these detailed elements together, thus 
creating a single whole. 
 
As teachers, we must be aware of the mental 
processes that lead to a better understanding of the 
text. This will help us decide what to do in class to 
help students read and listen better. 
 
In this article I am going to suggest some ideas for 
English lessons at academic lyceums or schools 
where students have pre-intermediate level of 
English. We define the topic. Good readers and 
listeners are able to identify the topic of a written or 
spoken text very quickly. This allows them to 
process the text more efficiently during the reading 
process. Before reading or listening, you can ask 
your students to brainstorm on what they already 
know about this topic, provide for the 
characteristics of the genre of the text, or ask what 
they want to learn from the text/ content (in such 
cases when they do not have enough prior 
knowledge on the topic of the text). 
We predict and make guesses. Both readers and 
listeners sometimes use guesses to try and 
understand what is written in the text or what is 
being talked about. Ask students to anticipate what 
will be discussed, to guess or guess the content at a 
glance or after listening to a small fragment. Further 
reading/listening will help them confirm their 
expectations. Use contextual and non-linguistic 
information (for example, drawings, text 
presentation and headings for reading, ask who 

communicates with whom, what and why - for 
listening). 
 
We pre-teach the key vocabulary. This helps with 
bottom-up text processing. However, this should 
not be abused, because then students will not learn 
to guess the meaning of words from the context. We 
use the techniques of skimming to read the text and 
listening for gist. Good readers and listeners are 
able to perceive the flow of discourse and 
understand its general essence without being 
distracted by details. By encouraging students to 
read or listen in order to grasp the essence, we help 
them to be prepared for reading and listening to 
more specific information. In this way, students will 
use their opportunities to take more for themselves 
from the top-down study of what is happening. We 
read and listen for specific information. We often 
turn to written or spoken text because we want 
specific details. Students should know how to 
ignore any other information and find specific 
information. We can ask our students, for example, 
to quickly review a movie review and find the name 
of the actor or director. 
 
We read and listen to understand the details. This 
also includes listening for conclusions about the 
attitude, intentions of the speaker, and the like. 
Such tasks are more demanding and require more 
intensive listening. It might be a good idea to split 
the recording into fragments, which will allow 
students to consult with each other before checking 
the assignment with the rest of the students. 
 
Now, I will give an example of lesson on reading 
where students are given a reading passage with 
top-down and then bottom-up processing activities 
in turn to achieve desirable result out of the lesson.  
Top-down processing activity in lesson can be 
begun with asking some questions to find out 
students’ prior knowledge on the topic of the 
reading passage: 



CURRENT RESEARCH JOURNAL OF PHILOLOGICAL SCIENCES 2(12):  
155-160, December 2021  
DOI: https://doi.org/10.37547/philological-crjps-02-12-30 
ISSN 2767-3758 
©2021 Master Journals 

   
  Accepted21thDecember, 2021 & Published 26thDecember, 2021 

 

 
 

 

CURRENT RESEARCH JOURNAL OF PHILOLOGICAL 
SCIENCES   ISSN – 2767-3758 

157 

  https://masterjournals.com/index.php/crjps 

- Do you like snow/winter/cold weather? 
- Have you ever made anything from ice or 

snow? 
- Can you imagine yourself sleeping in a cold 

room? 
 
Question like these gives students chance to think 
about the text’s general idea. Top-down processing 
begins with general idea into small details of the 
text. Asking students these questions a teacher can 

rise interest to the text and let them have the main 
idea of it. They will predict general idea and be 
ready to read the text with enthusiasm.  
Another activity on top-down processing can be 
mind-mapping on the main idea of the reading 
passage. In practice I usually show this mind-map 
before reading the reading passage in order to 
engage students into reading it with just simple 
words in a picture. 
 

 
 
 

Now, we can read the text. Usually, I give my students time to read according to word count of the text. 
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Top-down processing is helpful before reading the 
text and bottom-up, in turn, is effective while or 
after reading. Bottom-up processing activities I am 
giving in this article are to lead students deeper into 
the details. At the same time these activities help 

them learn new words effectively. First, I write new 
and target words on whiteboard and ask students 
their translation instead of telling myself.  
 

 
be into    check in    entirely 
build    art gallery    unusual 
unique                atmosphere    however 
temperature   surprisingly                  blanket 
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I can tell the translations when students don’t know 
them. Another bottom-up activity is made using 
web tool www.edu-games.org and are intended to 
repeat and learn how they are spelt. In my teaching 
practice, I found out that the more students repeat 
new and target words, the deeper they understand 
their meaning and usage in the given text. One of 
the exercises here is named as word scramble. 

Letters of the word is scrambled and students are 
asked to spell them correctly. The aim of this 
exercise is to think the spelling and the time they 
spend on thinking them is crucial in remembering 
for long time. Another exercise is word search 
which is made using new and target words from the 
reading passage. The aim is to help students 
concentrate on details of the text.

 
 

 
 

 
 

Both top-down and bottom-up processing are 
helpful in reading and listening in English classes.  
 

RESULTS AND DISCUSSIONS 

 
When top-down and bottom-up approaches are 
used in the lessons of English they are effective in 
terms of language competence is fulfilled. First, 
students are given the general idea of the text and 
then they read it. Bottom-up processing is held 
while or after reading due to the fact that it is about 
the small details. Results of the lesson with these 
approaches are usually high. The reading passage is 
discussed in two ways simultaneously. Some 
activities are added to increase the level of 
effectiveness. Another point for discussion is how to 
use these approaches in real classes. Teacher 
should pay attention to the reading passage or 

listening audio’s content. Then, he / she chooses 
activities that best suits to reveal true essence of the 
content. These approaches can improve students’ 
knowledge in case when teacher prepares suitable 
exercises to lead towards the main purpose of the 
reading passage or listening story/lecture.  
 

CONCLUSION 

 
Using top-down and bottom-up approaches in 
English classes is effective when these approaches 
accompanied by some related activities. In my 
teaching practice I use these approaches with 
reading and listening aspects. They are helpful 
when they are used in turn. The activities given in 
this article are prepared as sample that can be used 
in English classes. The activities can be changed 
according to reading passage’s content and topic.  
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Overall, using these techniques in English classes 
are effective and can improve learners’ knowledge 
on the topic discussed in short time. 
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