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INTRODUCTION 

 
As long as the culture of communication is based on 
knowledge and enlightenment, moral education, 
good knowledge of the heritage of our ancestors 
and devotion to our spiritual values, there is no 
doubt that it is an important sign of cultural and 
enlightenment development of society. Therefore, it 
is not difficult to understand this from the first days 
of our independence, when the focus was on 
spiritual and educational issues, education and 
upbringing. All the reforms in this area are based on 
the love and affection for our young people, who are 
the future of our country, the future of our people, 
more precisely, for a mentally and physically 
healthy, harmoniously developed generation. 
The laws of the Republic "On the State Language", 
"On Education", "National Training Program" and 
many other documents pay special attention to the 
above issues. 
 

We all need to understand that the concepts of 
communication and interaction have a socio-
political significance today. 
 
In the current complex and dangerous period of 
growing ideological, ideological and information 
struggles in the international arena, such tasks as: 
 
- the organization of spiritual and enlightenment 

propaganda in accordance with modern 
requirements;  

- protection of our youth from various 
ideological attacks, the formation of a conscious 
attitude to life;  

- increasing the sense of involvement in the 
events taking place, the independence of our 
country; 

- the consistent struggle against aggression that 
may threaten our peaceful life are becoming 
more and more actual. 

 

ABSTRACT  
 
The article describes the ideas of speech etiquette, methods of its use, factors of nonverbal communication. 
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METHODS 

 
Some gestures have come a long way in human 
development, and not only have they lost their 
original meaning in the course of evolution, but they 
have even changed them. For example, an 
undoubtedly friendly gesture, such as a smile, 
originally had the exact opposite meaning (meaning 
a threat) in our primitive past. Clearly, gestures are 
informative; it is not only national but also social 
and can be formed during a particular activity. 
 
Gestures, facial expressions, movements, glances - 
in short, the whole range of nonverbal ways of 
transmitting information - serves as a means of 
transmitting information to the outside world. This, 
of course, proves once again that nonverbal means 
are related to the human factor. 
 
In some cultures, the context is so important that in 
some cases the meaning of what is said can be 
reversed.  
 
That's why nonverbal communication is so 
important. In business conversations, for example, 
Uzbeks are closer to each other than Americans. In 
other words, Uzbeks have less social distance than 
Americans, and their personal or personal distances 
do not match. Such a reduction in social distance 
can be interpreted by Americans as a violation of 
morality. Prolonged distance is seen as a formality 
in Uzbek-Uzbek relations. After a few encounters, 
this misconception usually disappears. But first, this 
situation can lead to tension in the conversation. 
From the above, it can be surmised that people of 
different nationalities prefer the following distances 
when speaking: 
 
Close distance - Arabs, Japanese, South Americans, 
French, Greeks, blacks and Spaniards living in North 
America, Italians, Spaniards; 
Average distance - English, Swedish, Swiss, German, 

Austrian; 
 
Long distance - North Americans are white, 
Australians, New Zealanders. 
 
The use of gestures and symbols is one of the most 
common misunderstandings. Such gestures are 
often used when they do not know the language 
spoken by the interlocutor, but some try to explain 
themselves by believing that the gestures have the 
same meaning everywhere. This, in turn, leads to 
deep misunderstandings, ridicule, and sometimes 
embarrassment. 
 
Therefore, if you do not know the exact meaning of 
the gestures, it is better to exclude them completely 
when communicating with foreigners. This is 
because the gestures may not be understood by the 
other person or may have a different meaning. 
 
However, there is no denying that there are 
nonverbal behaviors that are common to many 
cultures. At the same time, people in different 
countries are developing their own rules for 
building their own nonverbal behavior. Each of 
these rules can be individual. Because even within a 
nation, some gestures can have different meanings 
in different situations. For example, if we raise our 
hand and shake it, depending on the situation, this 
gesture can be both a farewell and a greeting. In 
some cases, it may even mean "no." Or shaking your 
head can mean both denial and hesitation. This 
suggests that nonverbal means are also 
homonymous.  
 
Of course, all peoples have almost the same 
gestures, expressive signals (smiles, angry looks, 
frowning, shaking your head, etc.). However, there 
are many non-verbal means and customs that are 
accepted only by one nation. For example, in formal 
meetings, they usually shake hands when an 
agreement is reached. 
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CONCLUSION 

 
In general, a person uses five different sign systems 
in communication: words, intonation, tone of voice, 
gestures, and energy impulses. The first three 
belong to the field of traditional linguistics, the 
fourth to nonverbal communication, and the fifth to 
extralinguistics. 
 
The following conclusions were drawn from the 
study of the pragmatic features of nonverbal means 
of speech: 
 
Through speech, a person receives certain 
information in society, and at the same time 
transmits certain information through speech. It is 
in this process that nonverbal means emerge to 
increase the effectiveness of speech. In turn, 
nonverbal means are the main aids in the 
expression of language signs in speech. Exactly 
nonverbal means are considered to be one of the 
key factors in generating a pragmatic process in the 
speech process.  
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